

PUBLIC SERVICE BOARD - EL PASO WATER UTILITIES

TABULATION OF BIDS FOR: PIPE

BID TO BE OPENED: MARCH 19, 2018 @ 11:00 A.M.

BID NUMBER: 46-18

Prepared By: AG  
 Reviewed By: SC  
 Reviewed By: JD  
 Date: 3/20/18

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	PREV BID 3/17/16	CORE & MAIN	CLOWE & COWAN OF EL PASO, LLC	EL PASO PIPE & PUMP SUPPLY CO., INC.
					930 Pendale Rd. El Paso, TX 79907	11221 Rojas Dr. El Paso, TX 79935	7171 Chino Dr El Paso, TX 79922
1	Pipe Ductile 10 Inch	90	LF	\$21.13	\$20.12	\$17.95	
	TOTAL			\$1,901.70	\$1,810.80	\$1,615.50	NO BID
2	Pipe Ductile 12 Inch	1,440	LF	\$27.11	\$25.84	\$25.35	
	TOTAL			\$39,038.40	\$37,209.60	\$36,504.00	NO BID
3	Pipe Ductile 14 Inch	90	LF	\$34.66	\$32.54	\$33.24	
	TOTAL			\$3,119.40	\$2,928.60	\$2,991.60	NO BID
4	Pipe Ductile 16 Inch	1,440	LF	\$42.21	\$39.44	\$40.97	
	TOTAL			\$60,782.40	\$56,793.60	\$58,996.80	NO BID
5	Pipe Ductile 18 Inch	90	LF	48.87	\$46.74	\$48.70	
	TOTAL			\$4,398.30	\$4,206.60	\$4,383.00	NO BID
6	Pipe Ductile 20 Inch	1,440	LF	57.79	\$55.03	\$56.62	
	TOTAL			\$83,217.60	\$79,243.20	\$81,532.80	NO BID
7	Pipe Ductile 24 Inch	1,440	LF	71.47	\$73.17	\$76.72	
	TOTAL			\$102,916.80	\$105,364.80	\$110,476.80	NO BID
8	Pipe Ductile 4 Inch	420	LF	18.25	\$15.17	\$15.16	
	TOTAL			\$7,665.00	\$6,371.40	\$6,367.20	NO BID
9	Pipe Ductile 6 Inch	1,050	LF	12.32	\$11.83	\$11.71	
	TOTAL			\$12,936.00	\$12,421.50	\$12,295.50	NO BID
10	Pipe Ductile 8 Inch	1,050	LF	16.43	\$15.58	\$15.42	
	TOTAL			\$17,251.50	\$16,359.00	\$16,191.00	NO BID
11	Pipe PVC DR14 305 12 Inch	600	LF	16.93	\$25.42	\$21.48	
	TOTAL			\$10,158.00	\$15,252.00	\$12,888.00	NO BID
12	Pipe PVC DR14 305 6 Inch	600	LF	4.35	\$6.88	\$5.82	
	TOTAL			\$2,610.00	\$4,128.00	\$3,492.00	NO BID
13	Pipe PVC DR14 305 8 Inch	600	LF	7.37	\$11.82	\$9.99	
	TOTAL			\$4,422.00	\$7,092.00	\$5,994.00	NO BID
14	Pipe PVC DR18 12 Inch	8,000	LF	11.87	\$20.11	\$16.99	
	TOTAL			\$94,960.00	\$160,880.00	\$135,920.00	NO BID
15	Pipe PVC DR18 14 Inch	100	LF	19.39	\$27.03	\$23.50	
	TOTAL			\$1,939.00	\$2,703.00	\$2,350.00	NO BID
16	Pipe PVC DR18 235 18 Inch	200	LF	\$31.62	\$44.04	\$38.33	
	TOTAL			\$6,324.00	\$8,808.00	\$7,666.00	NO BID
17	Pipe PVC DR18 4 Inch	2,000	LF	\$1.80	\$2.75	\$2.33	
	TOTAL			\$3,600.00	\$5,500.00	\$4,660.00	NO BID
18	Pipe PVC DR18 235 6 Inch	8,000	LF	\$3.20	\$5.48	\$4.63	
	TOTAL			\$25,600.00	\$43,840.00	\$37,040.00	NO BID
19	Pipe PVC DR18 235 8 Inch	19,000	LF	\$5.57	\$9.48	\$8.01	
	TOTAL			\$105,830.00	\$180,120.00	\$152,190.00	NO BID

PUBLIC SERVICE BOARD - EL PASO WATER UTILITIES

TABULATION OF BIDS FOR: PIPE

BID TO BE OPENED: MARCH 19, 2018 @ 11:00 A.M.

BID NUMBER: 46-18

Prepared By: LTG  
 Reviewed By: SC  
 Reviewed By: JD  
 Date: 3/20/18

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	PREV BID 3/17/16	CORE & MAIN	CLOWE & COWAN OF EL PASO, LLC	EL PASO PIPE & PUMP SUPPLY CO., INC.
					930 Pendale Rd. El Paso, TX 79907	11221 Rojas Dr. El Paso, TX 79935	7171 Chino Dr El Paso, TX 79922
20	Pipe PVC C905 16 Inch	3,000	LF	25.15	\$35.04	\$30.46	
			TOTAL	\$75,450.00	\$105,120.00	\$91,380.00	NO BID
21	Pipe PVC DR18 235 10 Inch	100	LF	9.72	\$14.25	\$12.03	
			TOTAL	\$972.00	\$1,425.00	\$1,203.00	NO BID
22	Pipe PVC DR18 Blue 20 Inch	400	LF	38.99	\$44.13	\$47.24	
			TOTAL	\$15,596.00	\$17,652.00	\$18,896.00	NO BID
23	Pipe PVC C900 24 Inch	400	LF	56.18	\$78.35	\$68.13	
			TOTAL	\$22,472.00	\$31,340.00	\$27,252.00	NO BID
24	Pipe SWR PVC 12 Inch	1,000	LF	5.95	\$9.99	\$8.42	
			TOTAL	\$5,950.00	\$9,990.00	\$8,420.00	NO BID
25	Pipe SWR PVC 18 Inch	200	LF	15.65	\$21.36	\$18.58	
			TOTAL	\$3,130.00	\$4,272.00	\$3,716.00	NO BID
26	Pipe SWR PVC 15 Inch	200	LF	10.12	\$14.14	\$12.53	
			TOTAL	\$2,024.00	\$2,828.00	\$2,506.00	NO BID
27	Pipe SWR PVC 24 Inch	100	LF	28.51	\$37.80	\$32.86	
			TOTAL	\$2,851.00	\$3,780.00	\$3,286.00	NO BID
28	Pipe SWR PVC 4 Inch	2,000	LF	0.76	\$1.13	\$0.96	
			TOTAL	\$1,520.00	\$2,260.00	\$1,920.00	NO BID
29	Pipe SWR PVC 6 Inch	500	LF	1.69	\$2.47	\$2.09	
			TOTAL	\$845.00	\$1,235.00	\$1,045.00	NO BID
30	Pipe SWR PVC 8 Inch	5,000	LF	2.6	\$4.44	\$3.74	
			TOTAL	\$13,000.00	\$22,200.00	\$18,700.00	NO BID
31	Pipe Well Casing 12 Inch	210	LF	24.22	\$37.68	\$43.57	
			TOTAL	\$5,086.20	\$7,912.80	\$9,149.70	NO BID
32	Pipe Well Casing 16 Inch (21 Ft)	315	LF	N/A	\$47.47	\$55.07	
			TOTAL		\$14,953.05	\$17,347.05	NO BID
33	Pipe Well Casing 18 Inch (21 Ft)	42	LF	N/A	\$53.51	\$74.41	
			TOTAL		\$2,247.42	\$3,125.22	NO BID
34	Pipe Well Casing 20 Inch (21 Ft)	210	LF	N/A	\$59.54	\$71.71	
			TOTAL		\$12,503.40	\$15,059.10	NO BID
35	Pipe Well Casing 24 Inch (21 Ft)	210	LF	N/A	\$71.58	\$81.20	
			TOTAL		\$15,031.80	\$17,052.00	NO BID
36	Pipe Well Casing 30 Inch (21 Ft)	105	LF	N/A	\$96.47	\$124.06	
			TOTAL		\$10,129.35	\$13,026.30	NO BID
			DISCOUNT		RESIDENT BIDDER	RESIDENT BIDDER	RESIDENT BIDDER
			PAYMENT TERMS		NONE	NONE	N/A
					NET 30 DAYS	NET 30 DAYS	N/A