

PUBLIC SERVICE BOARD-EL PASO WATER UTILITIES

TABULATION OF BIDS FOR: PIPE AND VALVES

BID OPENED: 11:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME, July 17, 2017

BID NUMBER: 54-17

Prepared By: SC  
 Reviewed By: CR  
 Reviewed By: DD  
 Date: 7/31/17

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY		FERGUSON	CLOWE AND	HD SUPPLY	J & S VALVE	MORRISON SUPPLY
				WATERWORKS	COWAN OF EL	WATERWORKS	VALVE	COMPANY
				1010 Eastside Rd El Paso, TX 79915	11221 Rojas Dr. El Paso, TX 79935	930 Pendale El Paso, TX 79907	2323 1st Street Huffman, TX 77336	40 Butterfield Circle El Paso, TX 79906
1.	PIPE DUCTILE 8 INCH	1,440	UNIT	\$15.64	\$16.29	\$18.63		\$39.42
		LF	TOTAL	\$22,521.60	\$23,457.60	\$26,827.20	NO BID	\$56,764.80
2	PIPE DUCTILE 12 INCH	1,440	UNIT	\$25.81	\$26.77	\$30.74		\$59.93
		LF	TOTAL	\$37,166.40	\$38,548.80	\$44,265.60	NO BID	\$86,299.20
3	PIPE DUCTILE 16 INCH	1,440	UNIT	\$41.78	\$40.16	\$44.03		\$87.80
		LF	TOTAL	\$60,163.20	\$57,830.40	\$63,403.20	NO BID	\$126,432.00
4	PIPE DUCTILE 20 INCH	1,440	UNIT	\$57.75	\$54.57	\$62.41		\$116.89
		LF	TOTAL	\$83,160.00	\$78,580.80	\$89,870.40	NO BID	\$168,321.60
5	PIPE DUCTILE 24 INCH	1,440	UNIT	\$78.10	\$70.34	\$77.19		\$153.83
		LF	TOTAL	\$112,464.00	\$101,289.60	\$111,153.60	NO BID	\$221,515.20
6	PIPE PVC C900 DR18 8 INCH	10,000	UNIT		\$6.40	\$7.69		\$8.37
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$64,000.00	\$76,900.00	NO BID	\$83,700.00
7	PIPE PVC C900 DR18 12 INCH	10,000	UNIT		\$13.57	\$16.26		\$17.91
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$135,700.00	\$162,600.00	NO BID	\$179,100.00
8	PIPE PVC C900 DR18 18 INCH	2,000	UNIT		\$31.67	\$34.99		\$40.88
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$63,340.00	\$69,980.00	NO BID	\$81,760.00
9	PIPE PVC C905 DR18 16 INCH	3,000	UNIT		\$25.17	\$27.81		\$32.50
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$75,510.00	\$83,430.00	NO BID	\$97,500.00
						Bidders Total:		
						\$83,439.00		
10	PIPE PVC C905 DR18 20 INCH	4,000	UNIT		\$40.35	\$43.13		\$50.41
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$161,400.00	\$172,520.00	NO BID	\$201,640.00
11	PIPE PVC C905 DR18 24 INCH	3,000	UNIT		\$56.41	\$62.19		\$72.69
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$169,230.00	\$186,570.00	NO BID	\$218,070.00

PUBLIC SERVICE BOARD-EL PASO WATER UTILITIES

TABULATION OF BIDS FOR: PIPE AND VALVES

BID OPENED: 11:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME, July 17, 2017

BID NUMBER: 54-17

Prepared By: OC  
 Reviewed By: CR  
 Reviewed By: CR  
 Date: 7/31/17

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY		FERGUSON	CLOWE AND	HD SUPPLY	J & S VALVE	MORRISON SUPPLY
				WATERWORKS	COWAN OF EL	WATERWORKS	VALVE	COMPANY
				1010 Eastside Rd El Paso, TX 79915	11221 Rojas Dr. El Paso, TX 79935	930 Pendale El Paso, TX 79907	2323 1st Street Huffman, TX 77336	40 Butterfield Circle El Paso, TX 79906
12	PIPE SWR PVC 24 INCH	300	UNIT		\$30.12	\$30.00		\$34.91
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$9,036.00	\$9,000.00	NO BID	\$10,473.00
					1% Discount			
					\$29.82			
					\$8,946.00			
13	PIPE WELL CASING 12 INCH	840	UNIT		\$28.42	\$23.99		\$40.63
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$23,872.80	\$20,151.60	NO BID	\$34,129.20
14	PIPE WELL CASING 16 INCH	840	UNIT		\$40.09	\$29.83		\$52.56
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$33,675.60	\$25,057.20	NO BID	\$44,150.40
15	PIPE WELL CASING 18 INCH	840	UNIT		\$45.98	\$37.51		\$69.89
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$38,623.20	\$31,508.40	NO BID	\$58,707.60
16	PIPE WELL CASING 20 INCH	840	UNIT		\$51.34	\$41.91		\$67.05
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$43,125.60	\$35,204.40	NO BID	\$56,322.00
17	PIPE WELL CASING 24 INCH	840	UNIT		\$62.03	\$43.68		\$80.39
		LF	TOTAL	NO BID	\$52,105.20	\$36,691.20	NO BID	\$67,527.60
18	20" MECHANICAL JOINT GATE VALVE	5	UNIT	\$9,938.25		\$10,649.78	\$12,752.00	\$10,561.60
		EA	TOTAL	\$49,691.25	NO BID	\$53,248.90	\$63,760.00	\$52,808.00
19	20" FLANGED JOINT GATE VALVE	5	UNIT	\$9,938.25		\$10,649.78	\$12,752.00	\$10,561.60
		EA	TOTAL	\$49,691.25	NO BID	\$53,248.90	\$63,760.00	\$52,808.00
20	20" BUTTERFLY VALVE FLANGED W/EXTENSION	5	UNIT	\$2,798.95		\$3,386.36	\$4,672.00	\$3,427.20
		EA	TOTAL	\$13,994.75	NO BID	\$16,931.80	\$23,360.00	\$17,136.00
21	20" BUTTERFLY VALVE MECHANICAL JOINT W/EXTENSION	5	UNIT	\$2,745.59		\$3,534.03	\$4,672.00	\$3,371.20
		EA	TOTAL	\$13,727.95	NO BID	\$17,670.15	\$23,360.00	\$16,856.00
22	24" MECHANICAL JOINT GATE VALVE	5	UNIT	\$14,130.85		\$15,142.69	\$14,049.00	\$15,016.96
		EA	TOTAL	\$70,654.25	NO BID	\$75,713.45	\$70,245.00	\$75,084.80

